TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC
Lufkin, Texas 75904

Apeck Construction, LLC

Anacoco, Lousiana 71403

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Mansua, Louisiana 71350

Texas Materials a CRH Company

Jasper, Texas 75951

BID PACKAGE 1

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE .~ AMOUNT (%)
COUNTY ROAD 3750
Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control,
1 Complete for Duration of Project 1 LS $ $ - $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 7411799 § 7411799 | $ 101,368.67 $ 101,368.67
2 [Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 213 STA | $ - $ - $ 291.00 $ 61,983.00 | $ 49480 $ 105,392.40 | $ 545.10 $ 116,106.30
3 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ - $ - $ 23,217.00 $ 23,217.00 | $ 3,589.79 $ 3,589.79 [ $ 18,027.06  $ 18,027.06
4 |12” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 120 LF $ - $ - $ 117.00 | $ 14,040.00 | $ 12418 | $ 14,901.60 | $ 15254 | $ 18,304.80
5 |15 HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 125 LF |[$ - $ - $ 123.00  $ 15,375.00 | $ 135.59  § 16,948.75 | § 167.78  $ 20,972.50
6 |18” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 225 LF $ - $ - $ 127.00 | $ 28,575.00 | $ 140.68 | $ 31,653.00 | $ 183.02 | $ 41,179.50
7 |24” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 30 LF |[$ - $ - $ 150.00  $ 4,500.00 | $ 147.64  $ 4,429.20 | $ 193.62  $ 5,808.60
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section ) i
8 (TXDOT ltem 251), Complete in Place 35,964 | SY $ $ $ 3.00 $ 107,892.00 | $ 161 $ 57,902.04 | $ 556  $ 199,959.84
4” Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A,
9 Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place 35,964 | SY $ $ $ 21.00 $ 755,244.00 | $ 15.09 $ 542,696.76 | $ 1934 $ 695,543.76
10 |Roadway Turnout, Complete in Place 96 SY [$ - $ - $ 26.00 $ 2,496.00 | $ 39.73 § 3,814.08 [ $ 143.84 ' $ 13,808.64
11 |Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 389 SY [$ - $ - $ 24.00 $ 9,336.00 | $ 31.29 $ 12,171.81 [ $ 142.87 ' $ 55,576.43
12 Shoulder-Up, Fine Grading, Fertiization and Seeding, | 545 | grp | 4 -8 S 24200 $ 51,546.00 | $ 33388 § 7111644 | § 33198 § 70,711.74
Complete in Place
13 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 213 STA | $ - $ - $ 241.00  $ 51,333.00 | $ 4668 $ 994284 | $ 54222 | $ 115,492.86
14 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 1 1 LS |[$ - $ - $ 15,000.00  $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00  $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 $ 15,000.00
BID PACKAGE 1 TOTAL NO BID $1,147,519.00 $963,676.70 $1,487,860.70
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC | Apeck Construction, LLC Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC | Texas Materials a CRH Company
BID PACKAGE 2: BASE BID
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT (%) UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3910
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls | 75,000.00 $ 75,000.00 | $ 24,329.00  $ 24,329.00 | $ 67,620.12  $ 67,620.12 | § - ;
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 80,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 15,478.00 $ 15,478.00 | $ 7,358.34  $ 735834 | $ - $ -
3 |Demo Existing Structure, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 15,478.00 | $ 15,478.00 | $ 14,359.16 | $ 14,359.16 | $ - $ -
4 ::r:rislgfjsed Concrete Piling, 16", Battered, Complete | 550 | ¢ | ¢ 32000 $ 105,600.00 | $ 32400 $ 106,920.00 | $ 42223 § 139,335.90 | $ - ;
5 |Concrete Abutment, Complete in Place 36 CYy |[5$ 1,500.00  $ 54,000.00 | $ 1,974.00  $ 71,064.00 | $ 2,94394 | $ 10598184 $ - $ -
6 i:’:iressed Concrete I-Girder, Tx28, Complete in 200 Fols 40000 | $ 8000000 | § 201.00 | § 5820000 | § 15074 | § 0614800 | § ] . _
7 |Reinforced Concrete Bridge Deck, Complete in Place 1300 SF $ 60.00 | $ 78,000.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 118,300.00 | $ 69.87 | $ 90,831.00 | $ - $ -
g |Cement Stabilized Abutment Backfill, Option 1, 125 | cv | 29000 $ 36,250.00 | $ 249.00 $ 31,12500 | § 40540 $ 50,675.00 | $ - ;
Complete in Place
9 [Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 230 CcYy |$ 50.00  $ 11,500.00 | $ 66.00  $ 15,180.00 | $ 3247 | $ 746810 | $ - $ -
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
. 936 SY . , . . , . . , . - -
10 (TxDOT Item 251), Complete in Place $ 10.00  $ 9,360.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 12,168.00 | $ 552 | $ 516672 | $ $
11 |# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | gq5 | oy |4 2200 $ 20,592.00 | $ 2600 $ 24,336.00 | $ 1939 $ 18,149.04 | $ - ;
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
12 |Traffic Railing, T631LS, Complete in Place 150 LF $ 130.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 109.00 @ $ 16,350.00 | $ 8421 | $ 12,631.50 | $ - $ -
13 |Metal Beam Guard Fence, Complete in Place 150 LF $ 60.00  $ 9,000.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 5,850.00 | $ 9473 | $ 14,209.50 | $ - $ -
14 '\P/'ESGF SGT (Single Guardrail Terminal), Complete in 2 EA | 390000 $ 7,800.00 | $ 394300 $ 7,886.00 | $ 5269.89 10,539.78 | § - ;
15 :\:?D?aigm (Downstream Anchor Terminal), Complete | EA | 2,500.00 $ 5,000.00 | § 218100  § 4362.00 | $ 307032 § 6,140.64 | § - ;
16 |Concrete RipRap Slope Protection, CL "B", RRS, 240 | sy | 180.00 $ 43,200.00 | $ 117.00 $ 28,080.00 | $ 16620 §$ 39,888.00 | $ - ;
Complete in Place
17 |Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls | 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00 | $ 643500  $ 6,435.00 | $ 9,566.25  $ 9,566.25 | § - ;
Complete in Place
18 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,435.00  $ 6,435.00 | $ 4,880.63  $ 4,880.63 | $ - $ -
19 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 2 — CR 3910 1 LS 7,500.00 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00  $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00  $ 7,500.00 - $ -
COUNTY ROAD 3550
20 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls | 75,000.00 $ 75,000.00 | $ 24,329.00  $ 24,329.00 | $ 67,620.12  $ 67,620.12 | § - ;
Complete for Duration of Project
21 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 80,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 23,217.00 $ 23,217.00 | $ 7,358.34  $ 735834 | $ - $ -
22 |Demo Existing Structure, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 15,478.00 | $ 15,478.00 | $ 12,448.02 | $ 12,448.02 | $ - $ -
23 :Zrislgfssed Concrete Piling, 16", Battered, Complete | 0 | ¢ | ¢ 30000 § 171,000.00 | § 207.00 $ 117,990.00 | § 42724 § 243,526.80 | § - ;
24 |Concrete Abutment, Complete in Place 36 Cy |[5$ 1,500.00  $ 54,000.00 | $ 2,234.00 | $ 80,424.00 | $ 2,995.12 | $ 107,82432 | $ - $ -
25 ;raeiressed Concrete |-Girder, Tx28, Complete in 200 | LF |$ 40000 $ 80,000.00 | $ 291.00 §$ 58,200.00 | $ 48074 $ 96,148.00 | § - ;
26 |Reinforced Concrete Bridge Deck, Complete in Place 1300 SF $ 60.00 | $ 78,000.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 118,300.00 | $ 69.87 | $ 90,831.00 | $ - $ -
o7 |Cement Stabilized Abutment Backfill, Option 1, 125 | cv | 29000 $ 36,250.00 | $ 249.00 $ 31,2500 | § 40540 $ 50,675.00 | $ - ;
Complete in Place
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
. 1,426 SY . , . . , . . , . - -
28 (TxDOT Item 251), Complete in Place $ 10.00  $ 14,260.00 | $ 8.00  $ 11,408.00 | $ 563 | % 8,02838 | $ $
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TYLER COUNTY

GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM

GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC Apeck Construction, LLC Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC Texas Materials a CRH Company
29 |# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TXDOT Type A, | 4 o5 | gy | 2200 $ 31,372.00 | $ 2400 $ 34,224.00 | $ 2186 $ 31,172.36 | $ - .
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
30 [Traffic Railing, T631LS, Complete in Place 150 LF $ 130.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 109.00 @ $ 16,350.00 | $ 8293 | § 12,43950 | $ - $ -
31 [Metal Beam Guard Fence, Complete in Place 150 LF $ 60.00  $ 9,000.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 5,850.00 | $ 9473 | $ 14,209.50 | $ - $ -
32 '\P/'ES: SGT (Single Guardrail Terminal), Complete in 2 EA |3 3,900.00 $ 7,800.00 | § 3,94300 $ 7,886.00 | § 474432 $ 9,488.64 | $ - s .
33 :\:i?a':cgm (Downstream Anchor Terminal), Complete | EA |3 2,500.00  $ 5,000.00 | $ 2,181.00 § 4,362.00 | $ 257861 § 5157.22 | § - .
34 |Concrete RipRap Slope Protection, CL "B", RRS, 288 | sy |$ 180.00 $ 51,840.00 | § 11100 §$ 31,968.00 | $ 162,05  § 46,67040 | § - s .
Complete in Place
35 |24” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 30 | LF |$ 12500 $ 3,750.00 | $ 150.00 | § 4,500.00 | § 13390 § 4017.00 | § K -
36 [Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 7 SY |[$ 100.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 26.00 ' $ 182.00 [ $ 29287 | $ 2,050.09 | $ - $ -
37 |Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |s 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 643500 $ 6,435.00 | § 1134052 $ 11,34052 | $ - .
Complete in Place
38 [SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 835728 | § 8,357.28 | $ - $ -
39 [Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 2 — CR 3550 1 LS |$ 7,500.00  $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00  $ 7,500.00 | $ - $ -
BID PACKAGE 2: BASE BID $1,423,774.00 $1,181,639.00 $1,545,312.01 NO BID
BASE BID PACKAGE 2: ADDITIVE BID 1
ITEM | DESCRIPTION [ Qry | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE "~ AMOUNT (3) UNIT PRICE "~ AMOUNT () UNITPRICE | AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3430
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 45,000.00  $ 45,000.00 | $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 67,620.12 § 67,620.12 | § S .
Complete for Duration of Project
2 [Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$§ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 7,739.00  $ 7,739.00 | $ 735834 § 735834 | $ - $ -
3 |Dstour (Construct, Maintain and Demolish), Complete | Ls |s 40,000.00  $ 40,000.00 | § 241,819.00 $ 241,819.00 | $ 1596420  $ 15,964.20 | $ - s .
for Duration of Project
4 |Demo Existing Structure, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 12,448.02 | $ 12,448.02 | $ - $ -
5 gg:;rete Box Culvert, 5" Tall by 10" Wide, Complete in| o, | ¢ | 2,100.00 $ 109,200.00 | $ 241400 $ 125,528.00 | $ 2,717.15 | § 141,291.80 | § -8 -
6 |Concrete Headwall, Parallel, Complete in Place 2 EA | $ 48,00000 § 96,000.00 | $ 63,050.00 | $ 126,118.00 | $ 101,200.82 | $ 202,401.64 | $ K -
7 |Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 50 CYy [$ 295.00 | $ 14,750.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 10,200.00 | $ 405.40 | $ 20,270.00 | $ - $ -
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section ) i
8 [TXDOT ltom 251) Complete in Place 583 | sy |$ 800 $ 4,664.00 | $ 2000 $ 11,660.00 | $ 552§ 3,218.16 | $ $
g |4 Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | ga5 | gy | g 2000 §$ 11,660.00 | § 3100 §$ 18,073.00 | § 1939 $ 11,30437 | $ -8 .
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
10 |Traffic Railing, T631LS, Complete in Place 100 | LF | $ 13000 § 13,000.00 | $ 109.00 | § 10,900.00 | § 8421 $ 842100 | $ K -
11 |Metal Beam Guard Fence, Complete in Place 125 LF $ 50.00  $ 6,250.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 4,875.00 | $ 9473 | $ 11,841.25 | $ - $ -
12 '\P/'ES: SGT (Single Guardrail Terminal), Complete in 2 EA | 3,900.00 $ 7,800.00 | $ 3,943.00 $ 7,886.00 | $ 5269.89 10,539.78 | § - s .
13 :\:i?a':cgm (Downstream Anchor Terminal), Complete | EA |3 2,500.00  $ 5,000.00 | $ 2,181.00 § 436200 | $ 307032 $ 6,140.64 | $ - .
14 |Rock Rip Rap, 8”127 TxDOT ltem 432, Type F, 55 | sy | 13000  § 7,150.00 | $ 16400  $ 9,02000 | $ 16620  $ 9,141.00 | $ SR .
Complete in Place
15 [Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |s 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 643500 $ 6,435.00 | § 9,566.25  $ 9,566.25 | $ - .
Complete in Place
16 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,435.00  $ 6,435.00 | $ 4,880.63  $ 4,880.63 | $ - $ -
17 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 2 — CR 3430 1 LS |$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ - $ -
BASE BID PACKAGE 2: ADDITIVE BID 1 TOTAL $390,474.00 $610,771.00 $547,407.20 NO BID
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TYLER COUNTY

GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM

GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC

Apeck Construction, LLC

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Texas Materials a CRH Company

BID PACKAGE 3: BASE BID
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE " _AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 2900
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |3 8,000.00  $ 8,000.00 | $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 74117.99 74,117.99 | $ 68,91538 $ 68,915.38
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 s [ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 7,739.00 | § 7,739.00 | § 735834 § 735834 | $ 11,000.00 § 11,000.00
3 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 Ls [ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 23,217.00 | $ 23,217.00 | $ 3,589.79 | $ 3,589.79 | $ 11,000.00  § 11,000.00
4 [15" HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 25 | LF |$ 100.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 151.00 | § 3,775.00 | $ 13559 § 3,389.75 | § 27778 § 6,944.50
5 |Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 114 | CY | $ 70.00 | $ 7,980.00 | $ 66.00 $ 7,524.00 | $ 3247 § 3,701.58 | $ 74819 § 85,293.66
¢ |Scanfy, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section 992 | sy | 1000 $ 9,920.00 | $ 1200 $ 11,904.00 | $ 552§ 547584 | $ 3559 §$ 35,305.28
(TxDOT Item 251), Complete in Place
7 |# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | g, | gy | 1950  §$ 19,344.00 | $ 2600 $ 25,792.00 | § 1939 $ 1923488 | $ 3495 § 34,670.40
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
8 |Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 9 SY |[$ 50.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 23400 $ 29287 | $ 263583 | $ 71048 | $ 6,394.32
g |Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls |s 2,500.00  $ 2,500.00 | § 643500 $ 6,435.00 | § 1134052 $ 11,34052 | $ 5,500.00  $ 5,500.00
Complete in Place
10 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 4,000.00  $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 8,357.28 | $ 8,357.28 | $ 2,750.00  $ 2,750.00
11 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 3 — CR 2900 1 Ls | 2,500.00  $ 2,500.00 | § 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | § 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
COUNTY ROAD 2975
1o |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |3 9,000.00 $ 9,000.00 | $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 7411799 § 74117.99 | § 87,853.84 § 87,853.84
Complete for Duration of Project
13 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$§ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 7,739.00  $ 7,739.00 | $ 7,358.34  $ 735834 | $ 11,000.00  $ 11,000.00
14 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$§ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 7,739.00  $ 7,739.00 | $ 12,448.02  $ 12,448.02 | $ 11,000.00  $ 11,000.00
15 |36” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 60 | LF |$ 150.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 107.00 | § 6,420.00 | $ 159.00 | § 9,540.00 | $ 38830 § 23,298.00
16 |Cement Stabilized Backfill, Complete in Place 40 CYy [$ 295.00 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 8,160.00 | $ 40540 | $ 16,216.00 | $ 47696 | $ 19,078.40
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
17 . 220 | sy 10.00 2,200.00 52.00 11,440.00 161 354.20 70.21 15,446.20
(TxDOT Item 251), Complete in Place $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
18 ﬁegaeg;smb'"zat'o” Material, 36 LBS / SY, Complete | ™ | 40000 $ 1,600.00 | $ 598.00 $ 239200 | § 45000 $ 1,800.00 | § 43397 $ 1,735.88
19 [Mix and Compact Subgrade, Complete in Place 220 SY [$ 25.00 | $§ 5,500.00 | $ 86.00 $ 18,920.00 | $ 297 | $ 653.40 | § 66.01 $ 14,522.20
2o |4 Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TXDOT Type A, | 50 | gy | ¢ 2200 $ 4,840.00 | $ 53.00 § 11,660.00 | $ 1509 § 3319.80 | § 7168 $ 15,769.60
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
21 |Prime Coat, 0.15 Gal/SY, Complete in Place 220 | Sy |$ 200 $ 44000 | $ 200§ 44000 | $ 10.00 | $ 2,200.00 | § 636§ 1,399.20
22 |2’ Oil Sand Surface, Compacted, Complete in Place | 220 | sy |$ 4000 $ 8,800.00 | $ 4400 $ 9,680.00 | $ 4220 $ 9,284.00 | $ 19415 §$ 42,713.00
o3 |Rock Rip Rap, 127 - 18" TxDOT ltem 432, Type F, 50 | sy |$ 150.00 ' $ 7,500.00 | $ 17200 $ 8,600.00 | $ 16620 §$ 8,310.00 | $ 16500 §$ 8,250.00
Complete in Place
24 |Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls |s 3,000.00 $ 3,000.00 | $ 643500 $ 6,435.00 | § 1134052 $ 11,34052 | $ 5,500.00  $ 5,500.00
Complete in Place
25 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 6,435.00 | $ 9,566.25 | $ 9,566.25 | $ 2,750.00  $ 2,750.00
26 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 3 — CR 2975 1 LS |[$ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00  $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00  $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC

Apeck Construction, LLC

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Texas Materials a CRH Company

COUNTY ROAD 3265
o7 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 9,000.00  $ 9,000.00 | $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 74117.99  $ 74117.99 | $ 78,603.30 $ 78,603.30
Complete for Duration of Project
28 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 7,739.00  $ 7,739.00 | $ 7,358.34  $ 735834 | $ 11,000.00  $ 11,000.00
29 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 14,359.16 | $ 14,359.16 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00
30 |[36” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 30 LF $ 150.00 $ 4,500.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 3,210.00 | $ 159.00 | $ 4,770.00 | $ 330.00 $ 9,900.00
31 [Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 40 CYy [$ 295.00 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 8,160.00 | $ 3247 | $ 1,298.80 | $ 31797 | § 12,718.80
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
32 (TXDOT ltem 251), Complete in Place 986 SY $ 8.00 $ 7,888.00 | $ 12.00  $ 11,832.00 | $ 552 ' $ 544272 $ 26.86 | $ 26,483.96
4” Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A,
33 Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place 986 SY $ 2000 $ 19,720.00 | $ 26.00 $ 25,636.00 | $ 1939 § 19,1854 | $ 3077 ' § 30,339.22
34 [Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 20 SY $ 50.00  $ 1,000.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 520.00 [ $ 29287 | $ 585740 | $ 319.72 | § 6,394.40
35 |Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |3 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00 | $ 643500 $ 6,435.00 | $ 11,340.52  § 11,34052 | § 11,000.00 § 11,000.00
Complete in Place
36 [SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,435.00  $ 6,435.00 | $ 835728 § 8,357.28 | $ 5,500.00  $ 5,500.00
37 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 3 — CR 3265 1 LS |[$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00
BID PACKAGE 3: BASE BID TOTAL $215,782.00 $307,767.00 $467,731.07 $741,029.54
BID PACKAGE 3: ADDITIVE BID 2
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | QTy | UNIT | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE ~ AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3266
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 15,000.00  § 15,000.00 | § 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 74117.99 74,117.99 | $ 78,60330 $ 78,603.30
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 16,000.00  $ 16,000.00 | $ 23,217.00 $ 23,217.00 | $ 735834 § 7,358.34 | $ 11,000.00 $ 11,000.00
3 |Demo Existing Structure, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 7,739.00  $ 7,739.00 | $ 12,448.02  $ 12,448.02 | $ 11,000.00 $ 11,000.00
4 |30” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 60 LF $ 150.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 107.00  $ 6,420.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 330.00  $ 19,800.00
5 |Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 60 CY $ 295.00  $ 17,700.00 | $ 204.00  $ 12,240.00 | $ 40540 $ 24,324.00 | $ 31797 | § 19,078.20
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
6 (TXDOT Item 251), Complete in Place 3,189 SY $ 15.00 $ 47,835.00 | $ 8.00 $ 25,512.00 | $ 563 $ 17,954.07 | $ 1284 $ 40,946.76
4” Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A,
7 Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place 3,189 SY $ 20.00 $ 63,780.00 | $ 23.00 $ 73,347.00 | $ 2186  $ 69,711.54 | § 2993 | $ 95,446.77
8 |Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 149 SY |[$ 30.00 $ 4,470.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 3,874.00 | $ 29287 | $ 4363763 | $ 140.62 | $ 20,952.38
g [Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls |s 8,000.00  $ 8,000.00 | $ 12,869.00  $ 12,869.00 | $ 1134052 $ 11,34052 | $ 16,500.00  $ 16,500.00
Complete in Place
10 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00 | $ 12,869.00  $ 12,869.00 | $ 835728 $ 8,357.28 | $ 10,747.24 ' $ 10,747.24
11 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 3 — CR 3266 1 LS |$ 7,500.00  $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 $ 7,500.00
BID PACKAGE 3: ADDITIVE BID 2 TOTAL $197,285.00 $192,569.00 $285,749.39 $331,574.65
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC | Apeck Construction, LLC | Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC Texas Materials a CRH Company
BID PACKAGE 3: ADDITIVE BID 3
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | QTy | UNIT | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3660
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 22,000.00 $ 22,000.00 | $ 6,982.00 $ 6,982.00 | $ 74117.99 74,117.99 | $ 84,0330 $ 84,103.30
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 Ls [$ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 15,478.00  $ 15,478.00 | § 735834 § 7,358.34 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00
3 |Demo Existing Structure, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 7,739.00 | $ 12,448.02 | § 12,448.02 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00
4 |36” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 120 LF | $ 150.00 | § 18,000.00 | $ 107.00  $ 12,840.00 | $ 159.00  $ 19,080.00 | $ 330.00 | § 39,600.00
5 |Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 100 | cy | 250.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 204.00 $ 20,400.00 | $ 40540 | $ 40,540.00 [ $ 31797 § 31,797.00
6 |Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 673 | CY [$ 50.00  $ 33,650.00 | $ 61.00 $ 41,053.00 | $ 3247 | $ 21,852.31] § 7059 | $ 47,507.07
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
) 2,725 | SY . ,800. . 625. . ,042. . 316.
7 (TxDOT Item 251). Complete in Place $ 8.00 $ 21,800.00 | $ 500 $ 13,625.00 | $ 552 % 15,042.00 | $ 1296 $ 35,316.00
g |* Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | , 755 | gy | g 2000 § 54,500.00 | § 2400 $ 65,400.00 | § 1939 § 52,837.75 | § 2097 § 81,668.25
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
o |Rock Rip Rap, 8" - 12" TxDOT ltem 432, Type F, 585 | sy |$ 15000 § 87,750.00 | $ 109.00 | § 63,765.00 | $ 16620 § 97,227.00 | $ 13200 § 77,220.00
Complete in Place
10 |Roadway Turnout, Complete in Place 35 SY $ 50.00  $ 1,750.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 875.00 | $ 29287 | $ 10,250.45 | $ 20213 | $ 7,074.55
17 [Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |3 7,000.00  $ 7,000.00 | $ 643400 $ 6,434.00 | $ 11,340.52  § 11,34052 | § 11,000.00 § 11,000.00
Complete in Place
12 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 Ls [$ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | § 6,434.00 $ 6,434.00 | $ 8,357.28 § 8,357.28 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00
13 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 3 — CR 3660 1 LS |[$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00
BID PACKAGE 3: ADDITIVE BID 3 TOTAL $306,450.00 $266,025.00 $375,451.66 $447,786.17
BID PACKAGE 4: BASE BID
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | QTy | UNIT | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3709
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 28,000.00 $ 28,000.00 | $ 6,981.00 $ 6,981.00 | $ 74117.99 74,117.99 | $ 4920666 $ 49,206.66
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 Ls [$ 16,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 15,477.00  $ 15,477.00 | § 735834 § 7,358.34 | $ 13,851.37 | § 13,851.37
3 |Dstour (Construct, Maintain and Demolish), Complete | Ls |s 48,00000 § 48,000.00 | $ 241,81800  $ 241,818.00 | $ 10,000.00  $ 10,000.00 | $ 74,497.59  $ 74,497.59
for Duration of Project
4 |RockRip Rap, 18" - 24" TxDOT ltem 432, Type F, 684 | sy |s 160.00 $ 109,440.00 | § 143.00 $ 97,812.00 | $ 16620 §$ 113,680.80 | $ 16491 § 112,798.44
Complete in Place
5 |Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 25 cYy |$ 100.00  $ 2,500.00 | $ 114.00  $ 2,850.00 | $ 3247 § 811.75[ § 37790 $ 9,447.50
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
) 1469 | SY . ,690. . 752. . ,108. . ,710.
6 (TxDOT Item 251). Complete in Place $ 1000 $ 14,690.00 | $ 8.00 $ 11,752.00 | $ 552 % 8,108.88 | $ 661 $ 9,710.09
7 |# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | 4 159 | gy | g 2000 § 29,380.00 | § 2300 $ 33,787.00 | § 1939 § 2848391 § 2489 § 36,563.41
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
8 |Metal Beam Guard Fence, Complete in Place 375 LF [ $ 60.00 | $ 22,500.00 | $ 39.00  $ 14,625.00 | $ 9473 | $ 35,523.75 | $ 3850 $ 14,437.50
9 '\P/'ESGF SGT (Single Guardrail Terminal), Complete in 2 EA |3 4,00000 $ 8,000.00 | § 394284 § 7,885.68 | § 474432 $ 9,488.64 | $ 3,300.00  $ 6,600.00
10 [Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |s 17,500.00  § 17,500.00 | § 643400 $ 6,434.00 | $ 11,340.52  § 11,34052 | § 6,050.00 $ 6,050.00
Complete in Place
11 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 Ls |$ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 6,434.00 $ 6,434.00 | $ 8,357.28 § 8,357.28 | $ 592885 | $ 5,928.85
12 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 3709 1 LS |$ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
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GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419

TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM

December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC

Apeck Construction, LLC

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Texas Materials a CRH Company

COUNTY ROAD 3560
13 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 15,000.00 $ 15,000.00 | $ 6,981.00 $ 6,981.00 | $ 74117.99 7411799 | § 40,19527  $ 40,19527
Complete for Duration of Project
14 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 12,000.00  $ 12,000.00 | $ 15,477.00 $ 15,477.00 | $ 7,358.34  $ 735834 | $ 22,202.75  $ 22,202.75
15 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 7,738.00 | $ 7,73800 | $ 12,448.02 | $ 12,448.02 | $ 13,851.37 | $ 13,851.37
16 |36” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 120 | LF | 150.00 | § 18,000.00 | $ 10600 $ 12,72000 | § 159.00 | $ 19.080.00 | $ 27830 § 33,396.00
17 |Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 137 | cv | 60.00 | § 8,220.00 | $ 8400 $ 11,508.00 | § 3247 | $ 244839 | $ 24624 $ 33,734.88
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
18 . 1,991 | sy 10.00 19,910.00 6.00 11,946.00 5.63 209. . 480.
(TxDOT Item 251), Complete in Place $ $ $ $ $ $ 1120933 | $ 1330 § 26,480.30
4” Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A,
i 1,901 | sy . ,820. . 784. . 523. . ,769.
19 | Grade 2), Compacted, Complate in Place $ 2000 $ 39,820.00 | $ 2400 $ 47,784.00 | § 2186 $ 4352326 | $ 3002 $ 59,769.82
2o [Shoulder-Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls | s 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 6,43400 $ 6,434.00 | $ 11,34052  $ 1134052 | $ 8,800.00 $ 8,800.00
Complete in Place
21 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 THE 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,434.00 | $ 6,434.00 | $ 835728 | § 835728 | $ 592885 % 5,928.85
22 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 3560 1 LS |$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00
COUNTY ROAD 4151
»3 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls | s 8,000.00 $ 8,000.00 | $ 6,981.00 $ 6,981.00 | $ 7411799 $ 74,117.99 | $ 3598733 $ 35,987.33
Complete for Duration of Project
24 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 Ls [ 3,000.00  $ 3,000.00 | $ 15477.00 $ 15477.00 | $ 735834 | § 735834 | $ 2220275 | $ 22,202.75
25 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS |$ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,477.00 | $ 15477.00 | $ 1244802 $ 12,44802 | $ 2220275 | $ 22,202.75
26 |24” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 180 | LF |$ 10000 $ 18,000.00 | $ 13800 § 24,840.00 | $ 13390 | § 24,102.00 | $ 19362 | $ 34,851.60
27 gfacioncrete Safety End Treatment, 6:1, Completein |, | £, |¢ 1,800.00  $ 21,600.00 | $ 425900 $ 51,108.00 | § 1,00000  $ 12,000.00 | $ 347190 $ 41,662.80
28 |Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 67 SY $ 50.00  $ 3,350.00 | $ 25.00 | § 1,675.00 [ $ 29287 | $ 19,622.29 | $ 201.03 | $ 13,469.01
29 |Roadway Turnout, Complete in Place 26 SY $ 50.00  $ 1,300.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 29287 | $ 761462 | $ 27210 | $ 7,074.60
30 [|Shoulder-Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls | s 1,000.00  $ 1,000.00 | $ 6,43400 $ 6,434.00 | $ 11,340.52  $ 1134052 | $ 8,800.00 $ 8,800.00
Complete in Place
31 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 THE 2,00000 $ 2,000.00 | $ 6,434.00 | $ 6,434.00 | $ 835728 | § 835728 | $ 10,69846  $ 10,698.46
32 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 4151 1 Ls |s 2,000.00  $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00  $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00  $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
BID PACKAGE 4: BASE BID TOTAL $512,210.00 $711,453.68 $685,616.05 $789,899.95
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC

Apeck Construction, LLC

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Texas Materials a CRH Company

BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 4

ITEM | DESCRIPTION | Qry | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT (%) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT (%)
COUNTY ROAD 4400
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, 1 Ls |s 10,000.00  § 10,000.00 | § 6,981.00 $ 6,981.00 | $ 74117.99 74,117.99 | $ 3560873 $ 35,608.73
Complete for Duration of Project
2 |Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 7,738.00  $ 7,738.00 | $ 738434 § 7,384.34 | $ 22,202.75 $ 22,202.75
3 |36” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 90 LF $ 150.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 106.00  $ 9,540.00 | $ 159.00  $ 14,310.00 | $ 27830  $ 25,047.00
4 |Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 80 CY $ 295.00  $ 23,600.00 | $ 203.00  $ 16,240.00 | $ 405.40 | $ 32,432.00 | $ 230.53 ' $ 18,442.40
5 |Import Road Fill, Complete in Place* 275 CcYy |$§ 80.00 | $ 22,000.00 | $ 60.00 $ 16,500.00 | $ 3247  § 8,929.25 | $ 21146 | $ 58,151.50
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section
6 (TXDOT Item 251), Complete in Place 994 SY $ 10.00 $ 9,940.00 | $ 11.00  $ 10,934.00 | $ 552 $ 5486.88 | $ 1332 $ 13,240.08
4” Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A,
7 Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place 994 SY $ 20.00 $ 19,880.00 | $ 25.00 $ 24,850.00 | $ 1939  $ 19,273.66 | $ 3004 | $ 29,859.76
8 |Roadway Turnout, Complete in Place 25 SY |[$ 50.00 $ 1,250.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 29287 | $ 732175] $ 622.02 ' $ 15,550.50
g |Shoulder-Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | Ls |s 8,000.00  $ 8,000.00 | § 643400 $ 6,434.00 | § 1134052 $ 11,34052 | $ 8,800.00  $ 8,800.00
Complete in Place
10 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6,434.00 $ 6,434.00 | $ 835728 $ 835728 | $ 10,698.46  $ 10,698.46
11 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 4400 1 LS |$ 2,500.00  $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 4 TOTAL $119,670.00 $108,776.00 $191,453.67 $240,101.18
BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 5
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT (%) | UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT (%) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT (%)
COUNTY ROAD 3630 (MOOT MOORE RD)
Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control,
1 Complete for Duration of Project 1 LS $ 45,000.00 $ 45,000.00 | $ 6,981.00 $ 6,981.00 | $ - $ - $ 33,694.06 $ 33,694.06
2 [Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 7,738.00  $ 7,738.00 | $ - $ - $ 22,202.75  $ 22,202.75
3 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS $ 4,000.00  $ 4,000.00 | $ 7,738.00 | $ 7,738.00 | $ - $ - $ 18,027.06 | $ 18,027.06
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC Apeck Construction, LLC Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC Texas Materials a CRH Company
4 |Petour (Construct, Maintain and Demolish), Complete | Ls |s 29,000.00 $ 29,000.00 | $ 241,818.00  $ 241,818.00 | $ - $ 88,797.59  $ 88,797.59
for Duration of Project
5 |60” Steel Culvert, Standard Grade, Complete in Place 66 LF [$ 1,100.00 | $ 72,600.00 | $ 556.00 | $ 36,696.00 | $ - $ $ 97397 $ 64,282.02
6 |[Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 90 CYy |$ 295.00 | $ 26,550.00 | $ 203.00 | $ 18,270.00 | $ - $ $ 127.19 | $ 11,447.10
7 [Concrete Headwall, Parallel, Complete in Place 2 EA |$ 54,000.00 | $ 108,000.00 | $ 63,058.00 | $ 126,116.00 | $ - $ $ 16,500.00 | $ 33,000.00
Pulvermix, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section )
8 (TXDOT ltem 251), Complete in Place 932 SY $ 18.00 $ 16,776.00 | $ 16.00  $ 14,912.00 | $ $ $ 1925 $ 17,941.00
g |# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (TxDOT Type A, | g5, | gy | 2500 § 23,300.00 | § 2500 $ 23,300.00 | $ R $ 4263 $ 39,731.16
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
10 |Rock Rip Rap, 87- 12" TxDOT Item 432, Type F, 194 | sy |3 15000 § 29,100.00 | $ 127.00  $ 24,638.00 | $ B $ 18612 § 36,107.28
Complete in Place
11 |Traffic Railing, T631LS, Complete in Place 100 LF $ 150.00  $ 15,000.00 | $ 109.00 | $ 10,900.00 | $ - $ $ 77.00 | $ 7,700.00
12 |Metal Beam Guard Fence, Complete in Place 1355 LF $ 100.00 | $ 13,550.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 528450 | $ - $ $ 3850 | $ 5,216.75
13 lfgt:;f't Existing MBGF to New MBGF, Complete in 1 Ls |3 8,000.00 § 8,000.00 | $ 2,091.00 $ 2,091.00 | $ - $ 3,850.00 $ 3,850.00
14 '\P/'IESGF SGT (Single Guardrail Terminal), Complete in 1 EA |3 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 394300 §$ 3,943.00 | $ B $ 3,850.00 $ 3,850.00
15 :\:?D?aigm (Downstream Anchor Terminal), Complete | EA |$ 4,000.00 $ 4,000.00 | $ 2,181.00 $ 2,181.00 | $ - $ 165000 $ 1,650.00
16 |Shoulder-Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls |s 4,00000 $ 4,000.00 | $ 643400 $ 6,434.00 | § B $ 8,800.00 § 8,800.00
Complete in Place
17 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$§ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,434.00  $ 6,434.00 | $ - $ $ 19,355.50  $ 19,355.50
18 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 3630 1 LS |$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ - $ $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00
BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 5 TOTAL $420,876.00 $550,474.50 NO BID $420,652.27
BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 6
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT (%) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE \ AMOUNT ($) UNIT PRICE AMOUNT ($)
COUNTY ROAD 3050
1 |Bonding, Insurance, Mobilization and Traffic Control, | | g ¢ 1900000 $ 19,000.00 | $ 8679.00 $ 8679.00 | $ - s $ 35181.35 35,181.35
Complete for Duration of Project
2 [Right of Way Preparation, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 7,738.00  $ 7,738.00 | $ - $ $ 22,202.75  $ 22,202.75
3 |Demo Existing Structures, Complete in Place 1 LS |[$ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 7,738.00  $ 7,738.00 | $ - $ $ 22,202.75  $ 22,202.75
4 |15” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 25 LF $ 100.00 $ 2,500.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 3,225.00 [ $ - $ $ 173.28 | $ 4,332.00
5 |24” HDPE Culvert, Complete in Place 60 LF $ 125.00 $ 7,500.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 8,280.00 | $ - $ $ 193.62 | $ 11,617.20
6 [Cement Stabilized Sand, Complete in Place 40 CYy |$ 295.00  $ 11,800.00 | $ 203.00 $ 8,120.00 | $ - $ $ 23848  $ 9,539.20
Scarify, Reshape and Recompact Roadway Section )
7 (TXDOT ltem 251), Complete in Place 997 SY $ 10.00  $ 9,970.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 10,967.00 | $ $ $ 1948 | § 19,421.56
8 ﬁegl‘aegé Stabilization Material, 36 LBS / SY, Complete | 5|y | ¢ 35000 $ 6300.00 | $ 31600 § 5,688.00 | $ -8 $ 43397 § 7,811.46
9 [Mix and Compact Subgrade, Complete in Place 997 SY [$ 20.00  $ 19,940.00 | $ 16.00  $ 15,952.00 | $ - $ $ 2112 ' § 21,056.64
10 [# Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (XDOT Type A, | o7 | gy | 2500 § 24,925.00 | § 2600 $ 25,922.00 | $ R $ 3790 § 37,786.30
Grade 2), Compacted, Complete in Place
11 |2” Oil Sand Surface, Compacted, Complete in Place 997 SY |$ 40.00 $ 39,880.00 | $ 27.00 $ 26,919.00 | $ - $ $ 4232 ' $ 42,193.04
1o |Rock Rip Rap, 8" - 12" TxDOT ltem 432, Type F, 89 | sy |[$ 15000 § 13,350.00 | $ 131.00 § 11,659.00 | $ B $ 24327 § 21,651.03
Complete in Place
13 |Roadway Turnout, Complete in Place 50 SY |$ 85.00 $ 4,250.00 [ $ 56.00  $ 2,800.00 | $ - $ $ 28272 | $ 14,136.00
14 |Driveway Turnout, Complete in Place 11 SY |$ 70.00 | $ 770.00 | $ 56.00  $ 616.00 [ $ - $ $ 643.83  $ 7,082.13
15 [Shoulder Up, Fine Grading, Fertilization and Seeding, | 4 Ls | 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 | $ 6,434.00 $ 6,434.00 | § B $ 8,800.00 § 8,800.00
Complete in Place
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TYLER COUNTY
GLO CDBG MIT PROGRAM
GLO CONTRACT NO. 22-119-009-D419
December 19, 2023 @ 10:00 AM
GLS No. 203058

Aaron Davis Construction, LLC

Apeck Construction, LLC

Tunica-Biloxi Services, LLC

Texas Materials a CRH Company

16 |SWPPP and Dress-Up, Complete in Place LS 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 6,434.00  $ 6,434.00 - $ 13,956.60 $ 13,956.60
17 |Laboratory Testing Allowance, Package 4 — CR 3050 LS 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 - $ 5,000.00  $ 5,000.00
BID PACKAGE 4: ADDITIVE BID 6 TOTAL $183,185.00 $162,171.00 NO BID $303,970.01
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